
Black and White Images by Jack Ahearn

These photographs are lyrical expressions of the natural world that elicit emotional re-
sponses in the viewer including joy, sadness, and an elusive “otherness” perhaps related to 
Emerson’s concept of the “Wise Silence.”  Landscape and still life are the basis for the imag-
es that are crafted so that the final image creates a rewarding and pleasurable experience in 
the viewer.

The photographs in the show were made over a long period of time and include images 
from New Hampshire, Maine, Newfoundland, Nova Scotia, Death Valley, Virginia, Colo-
rado and Maryland.  The emphasis  of the show is  focused on the last ten years or so of my 
work, and there is some concentration on images made from New Hampshire landscapes.

My earliest recollection of a sustained interest in photography dates from my college ex-
perience at St. Lawrence University where I had opportunities to take several workshops 
with master photographers Minor White and Paul Caponigro.  After college and graduate 
school in physics, I pursued a career in scientific research, making photographs on occa-
sion over the years. Recently, since 2002, my prime focus is on fine art photography.
 
I  have pursued additional training in photography in recent times including workshops 
with master photographer John Sexton at Anderson Ranch, Professor Craig Stevens (Sa-
vannah College of Art and Design) at the Maine Photographic Workshops, and Gary Sam-
son at the New Hampshire Institute of Art. These activities are invaluable in providing 
direct experience with leading photographers and insight into current methodology and 
technology in the photographic field.

I work primarily with a 4x5 view camera, recording the image on film and developing in-
dividual negatives in the wet darkroom. I have produced silver prints in the traditional wet 
darkroom for many years and, in addition, I now use digital techniques to craft the images 
recorded on film and print them using the inkjet process. The silver and inkjet print pro-
cesses each offer their own individual expressive possibilities.  Most recently I have used a 
digital camera to capture images that are then rendered in grey scale and printed with an 
inkjet printer.

Additional information, photographs can be found at:  

Lyrical Nature

www.jackahearnphotography.com
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